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Hebrews 4: 

14. Having therefore a great High Priest, Who 
has passed into the heavens, Jesus the Son of 
God, we should hold fast the confession of our 

faith. 
 

15. For we do not have a high priest who cannot 
empathize with our weaknesses, but One Who 

was tempted in all things according to the 
likeness of our own temptations; yet He was 

without sin. 
 

16. Therefore, we should come with boldness to 
the throne of grace, so that we may receive 

mercy and find grace to help in time of need. 

(A Faithful Version)  

Prayer Request 

For the BRETHREN IN AUSTRALIA 
 

The following is a prayer request received from 
a Church of God member living in Australia.  

______________________________________
___ 

"We would be thankful for prayers for my family 
and all of God’s people in Australia. Over these 
past two years the Australian government has 
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been exerting more and more tyrannical power 
and control over every state and Territory but it 
has now reached a critical stage with deadlines 

in place to punish and discriminate against 
those who do not accept the Covid vaccine. My 

family and I reject the Covid-19 injection and 
PCR test in accordance with God’s Law. We 
also believe the injection is dangerous and 

poisonous. 

Numerous mandates are already in place which 
includes tracking and tracing people’s 

movements with a mandatory check-in app for 
the purposes of testing and quarantining. 

December 17 is the deadline for all 
unvaccinated people to get the Covid-19 

injection in Queensland, Australia. Anyone who 
is not vaccinated by that date will not be allowed 
to access numerous health services, hospitality 
venues, hotels, and community services without 
the vaccine. As a consequence of the vaccine 

mandates, many of God’s people across 
Australia have already lost their employment 

and will continue to lose their jobs. 

Quarantine Covid camps have been built in 
different locations around Australia. The military 
has already begun removing people (including 

children) from their homes in the Northern 
Territory, detaining them in a camp and forcibly 
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injecting them with the Covid-19 injection 
against their will. Those who still remain in the 
community in the Northern Territory have had 
essential services such as food, electricity and 
internet withheld as a means of coercing and 

pressuring them into getting the vaccine. 

There is a concern that the government is also 
expected to pass a pandemic bill this coming 

week in Victoria, Australia. It will allow the 
government to have extraordinary draconian 

powers against people based on their religion, 
gender and political beliefs. If passed, it will 
allow indefinite lockdowns. It would give the 

police the power to arrest people based on their 
religion, and detain people indefinitely as well as 
imprison people without a trial. It is a shocking 
piece of legislation overruling the most basic 

human rights. 

We ask for prayers that the Australian brethren 
will be protected and be able to remain safely in 
our homes without the threat of being removed 
and detained in a quarantine facility. While we 
can still access essential services such as food 
for the time being, we are concerned that in the 

very near future, we will not be permitted to 
enter any store to buy essentials without the 
vaccine. The Health department has warned 
that the unvaccinated will live very lonely and 
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miserable lives and have nowhere to hide. 
Please pray that we will be able to move freely 
in the community unnoticed by the authorities 

and be able to access all of the basics. We ask 
that God gives us the strength to endure these 

very troubling times and trials. 

These are dangerous times for all of God’s 
people worldwide. What is unfolding in Australia 
is setting an unconscionable precedent for the 

rest of the world to follow." 

 


